CONTRACT ADDENDUM

CITY OF TUCSON BUSINESS SERVICES DEPARTMENT CONTRACT # 212528-01
255 W. ALAMEDA, 6TH FLOOR, TUCSON, AZ 85701 CONTRACT ADDENDUM NUMBER: TEN (10)
P.O. BOX 27210, TUCSON, AZ 85726 PAGE 1 of 2
PHONE: (520) 837-6685 / FAX: (520) 791-4735 AK
Andrew.klos@tucsonaz.gov CONTRACT OFFICER: Andrew Klos, MBA, CPPB

ISSUE DATE: JULY 27, 2023

WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS (POLYMERS AND MISC.)

THIS CONTRACT IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

ITEM ONE (1): RENEWAL

In accordance with Contract Special Terms and Conditions, Section 5, “Term and Renewal”, the City hereby
exercises its option to renew the contract for the period of October 1, 2023 through September 30, 2024.

ITEM TWO (2): PRICE ADJUSTMENT

In accordance with Contract Special Terms and Conditions, Section 4, “Price Adjustment”, the City hereby
accepts the proposed price adjustment (Attachment A).

**END OF ADDENDUM ITEMS***
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ALL OTHER PROVISIONS OF THE CONTRACT SHALL REMAIN IN THEIR ENTIRETY.

CONTRACTOR: Thatcher Company of Arizona. Inc. CITY OF TUCSON:
CONTRACTOR HEREBY ACKNOWLEDGES RECEIPT OF THE ABOVE REFERENCED CONTRACT ADDENDUM

AND UNDERSTANDING OF THE ABOVE ADDENDUM

1S HEREBY EXECUTED THIS 28th DAY
AN /i =
-~ OF , 2023 AT TUCSON, ARIZONA.
(Al O

Signature 6f person authorized to sign Date
7/28/2023 i L 9W for
. Thatcher, C.E.O. Z

Director of Budihess Services and not personally

Craig
Name and Title (typed or printed legibly)

Thatcher Company of Arizona, Inc.
Company Name

P. O. Box 27407

Address
craig.thatcher@tchem.com;

wendy.richmond@tchem.com
Email Address

Salt Lake City ut 84127-0407
City State Zip

Contact information for Sales/Account
Representative for daily business operations:

Robert Dubel, Account Manager
Name and Title (typed or printed legibly)
(480) 248-4748

Phone Number

robert.dubel@tchem.com
Email Address




212528-01: Pricing effective 8/1/2023 through 1/31/2024

Item No.

Description

Thatcher Part
Number

Estimate
d Annual
Quantity

uom

National
Freight Charge per
UOM mile*

New Price

Aluminum Sulfate
Minimum Shipping
Quantity 21,483 dry
(44,000 "as is"lbs)

Soda Ash (Sodium
Carbonate, Dry)
Minimum Shipping
Quantity 44,000 lbs
Soda Ash 50# Bag
(minium shipping
quantity 42,000
LBS)

Sodium Bisulfite
Minimum Shipping
Quantity 18,000 lbs

Sodium
Hypochlorite
Minimum Shipping
Quantity 4,400 Gal
Sodium Hydroxide
25%

Minimum Shipping
Quantity 44,000
Wet Lbs

Ammonia

Anhydrous
Minimum Shipping
Quantity 44,000Lbs.

1115000

2220000

2220200

2237050

2434000

1316000

1153000

500,000

25,000

42,000

900,000

2,000,000

85,000

10,000

Dry lbs

Dry lbs

dry

Dry lbs

Gallon

Wet Lbs

Wet Lbs

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

$ 0.340

$ 0.3600

$ 0.3200

$ 0.78

$ 4.34

$ 0.3600

$ 2.1500




10A.

10B.

10C.

19% Ammonium

Hydroxide
Minimum Shipping
Quantity 8,360 dry Ibs.
(44,000 "as is") Ibs.

Chlorine Eastern
Valve
Minimum Shipping
Quantity 24,000
LBS (Was 44,000
Lbs)

Copper Sulfate

Minimum Shipping
Quantity 42,000 LBS

Ferric Sulfate 10%
Iron
Minimum Shipping
Quantity 4,400 Dry
Lbs (44,000 "as is"
Ibs)

Ferric Sulfate 12%n
Iron

Minimum Shipping
Quantity 5280 Dry
LBS (44,000 "as is"
Ibs)

Ferric Sulfate 13%

Iron

Minimum Shipping

Quantity 5720 Dry

Lbs (44,000 "as is"
Ibs.)

1159000

1336309

1411201

1551000

1555000

1558000

10,000

10,000

10,000

10,000

10,000

10,000

Dry Lbs

LBS (Not

Gal)

Dry Lbs

Dry Lbs

Dry Lbs

Dry Lbs

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

1.5300

1.6100

3.3500

1.0500

1.0300

No Bid



11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

18.

Sodium Fluoride

Quantity —10:120dry
‘ !ggg “as .S” I:Bs)

Hydrofluorosilicic
Acid Minimum Shipping

Quantity 10,120 dry
(44,000 "as is" LBS)

Lime Foundry Quick

Grade Minimum Shipping
Quantity 44,000 Ibs.

Lime Hydrated
Minimum Shipping
Quantity 44,000 Lbs

Pebble Quick Lime
Minimum Shipping Quantity
44,000 Lbs

Robraluminum-
Lbs

Polyaluminum
Hydroxychlorosulfat

€ Minimum Shipping
Quantity 44,000 Lbs

1722000

1806000

1803000

1807050

2481000

10,000

10,000

10,000

10,000

10,000

10,000

Dry Ibs

Dry Ibs

Dry lbs

Dry lbs

Dry lbs

Wetdbs-

Wet Ibs (
Not Dry)

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

No Bid

No-Bid

$ 2.8300

$ 0.2369

$ 0.2400

No Bid

$ 0.77



20.

21.

22.

23.

24,

25.

26.

27.

Polyphosphate
Minimum Shipping Quantity
44,000 Lbs

Potassium

Permanganate
Minimum Shipping Quantity
43,982 Lbs

Powdered Activated

Charcoal  Minimum
Shipping Quantity 40,000
Lbs

Sodium
Hexametaphosphat
€  Minimum Shipping
Quantity 44,000 Lbs

Sulfur Dioxide
Minimum Shipping Quantity
44,000 Lbs

Sulfuric Acid

Minimum Shipping Quantity
40,900 Lbs (44,000 "as is"
Ibs

Zinc
Orthophosphate
Minimum Shipping
QuantityM
(44,000 "as is" Ibs.)
Citric Acid
Minimum Shipping
Quantity 44,000 lbs
Liquid Oxygen
Minimum Shipping
Quantity

2586000

2087100

No Bid

No Bid

2348394

2363000

1305000

1354000

10,000

10,000

10,000

10,000

10,000

10,000

10,000

10,000

396,000

Wet Ibs (
not Dry)

Dry Lbs

Dry Ibs

Dry Ibs

Wet Ibs (Not
Dry)

Dry Ibs

Dry Ibs

Wet Ibs

Gal

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

3.2

$ 0.9800

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 0.2000

$ 1.8600

$ 1.1100

No Bid



Hydrogen Peroxide
34% Minimum

Shipping Quantity 4
drums

S Qe 1730000 413,170 Wet Lbs 3.2 $ 0.4100
28. 41,0601bs
$ -
$ -
$ -
1. Methanol 1877000 7,000 Gal 3.200 $ 3.1700
Mississippi Lime
No Bid 48,000 Lbs 3.20 No Bid
2.
3. T-Floc 1417 2448000 32,900 Lbs 3.200 $ 0.9900
48,000 Dry Lbs 3.200 $ 3.0200
T1-2904 330lb
Drum Minimum
Shipping Quantity 4 2586100 5,280 Wet Lbs 3.20| $ 3.4200
6. drums
TI-2904 610lb
Drum Minimum
2586101 9,760 Wet Lbs 3.20| $ 2.6700




10.

11.

12.

T Chlor 10% G Bulk

46QO/G Minnimum 2433000
Delivery

T Chlor 10% 55G Drums

220(G Minnimum 2 433,100
Delivry

Ferric Chloride 38-40%
3900{# Totes 9900/# 1546150
minnimum Delivery

T Floc 4063 450/# Drum

3600/# minnimum 2476100
Delivery

Methanol 275G Drum

825/G minnimum 1877007
delivery

12,000

1,100

60,000

3,600

6,000

G Bulk

G Drum

Wet Lbs

Wet Lbs

Gallon

$3.20

$3.20

$3.20

$3,20

320 $

3.0200

8.6800

0.9200

2.7000

5.9300
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