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Item No. Description

Thatcher Part 

Number

Estimate

d Annual 

Quantity

UOM  

National

Freight Charge per 

UOM mile*

New Price  

1.

Aluminum Sulfate
Minimum Shipping

Quantity   21,483 dry

(44,000 "as is"lbs)

1115000 500,000 Dry lbs  3.2 0.360$    

2.

Soda Ash (Sodium 

Carbonate, Dry)
Minimum Shipping

Quantity   44,000 lbs

2220000 25,000 Dry lbs 3.2 0.4182$     

Soda Ash 50# Bag 

(minium shipping 

quantity 42,000 

LBS)

2220200 42,000 dry 3.2 0.3914$     

3.

Sodium Bisulfite
Minimum Shipping

Quantity   18,000 lbs 2237050 900,000 Dry lbs 3.2 0.70$    

4.

Sodium 

Hypochlorite
Minimum Shipping

Quantity   4,400 Gal

2434000 2,000,000 Gallon 3.2 4.32$    

5.

Sodium Hydroxide 

25%

Minimum Shipping

Quantity   44,000 

Wet Lbs

1316000 85,000 Wet Lbs 3.2 0.4120$     

6.

Ammonia 

Anhydrous
Minimum Shipping

Quantity 44,000Lbs.

1153000 10,000 Wet Lbs 3.2 2.4720$     
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7.

19% Ammonium  

Hydroxide
Minimum Shipping

Quantity 8,360 dry lbs.

(44,000 "as is") lbs.

1159000 10,000 Dry Lbs 3.2 1.6717$     

8.

Chlorine Eastern 

Valve

Minimum Shipping

Quantity   24,000  

LBS (Was 44,000 

Lbs)

1336309 10,000
LBS (Not 

Gal)
3.2 1.4832$     

9.

Copper Sulfate 
Minimum Shipping

Quantity   42,000 LBS

1411201 10,000 Dry Lbs 3.2 3.2500$     

10A.

Ferric Sulfate 10% 

Iron

Minimum Shipping

Quantity 4,400 Dry 

Lbs (44,000 "as is" 

lbs)

1551000 10,000 Dry  Lbs 3.2 1.1357$     

10B.

Ferric Sulfate 12%n 

Iron

Minimum Shipping

Quantity 5280 Dry 

LBS (44,000 "as is" 

lbs)

1555000 10,000 Dry Lbs 3.2 1.1231$     

10C.

Ferric Sulfate 13% 

Iron

Minimum Shipping

Quantity 5720 Dry 

Lbs  (44,000 "as is" 

lbs.)

1558000 10,000 Dry Lbs 3.2 No Bid



11.

Sodium Fluoride

10,000 Dry lbs 3.2 No Bid

12.

Fluorosilicic Acid 
Minimum Shipping

Quantity   10,120 dry

(44,000 "as is" LBS)

1722000 10,000 Dry lbs $    3.00    No Bid

13.

Hydrofluorosilicic 

Acid Minimum Shipping

Quantity   10,120 dry

(44,000 "as is" LBS)

1722000 10,000 Dry lbs  3.2 2.1630$     

14.

Lime Foundry Quick 

Grade Minimum Shipping 

Quantity  44,000 lbs.
1806000 10,000 Dry lbs 3.2 0.2369$     

15.

Lime Hydrated 

Minimum Shipping 

Quantity 44,000 Lbs

1803000 10,000 Dry lbs 3.2 0.2781$     

16.

Pebble Quick Lime 
Minimum Shipping Quantity 

44,000 Lbs

1807050 10,000 Dry lbs 3.2 No Bid

17.

Polyaluminum 

Chloride       Minimum 

Shipping Quantity 44,000 

Lbs 2481000 10,000  Wet lbs $    3.00    No Bid

18.

Polyaluminum 

Hydroxychlorosulfat

e Minimum Shipping 

Quantity 44,000 Lbs

2481000 10,000
 Wet lbs ( 

Not Dry)
3.2 0.75$         



19.

Polyphosphate      
Minimum Shipping Quantity 

44,000 Lbs

2586000 10,000
 Wet lbs  ( 

not Dry)
3.2 0.9270$     

20.

Potassium 

Permanganate 
Minimum Shipping Quantity 

43,982 Lbs

2087100 10,000 Dry Lbs 3.2 No Bid

21.

Powdered Activated 

Charcoal    Minimum 

Shipping Quantity 40,000 

Lbs

No Bid 10,000 Dry  lbs 3.2 No Bid

22.

Sodium 

Hexametaphosphat

e    Minimum Shipping 

Quantity 44,000 Lbs

No Bid 10,000 Dry lbs 3.2 No Bid

23.

Sulfur Dioxide                    
Minimum Shipping Quantity 

44,000 Lbs 2348394 10,000
 Wet lbs (Not 

Dry) 
3.2 No Bid

24.

Sulfuric Acid                   
Minimum Shipping Quantity 

40,900 Lbs (44,000 "as is" 

lbs)

2363000 10,000 Dry lbs 3.2 0.2266$     

25.

 Zinc 

Orthophosphate 
Minimum Shipping

Quantity  17,600 lbs.

(44,000 "as is" lbs.)

1305000 10,000 Dry lbs 3.2 1.8025$     

26.

Citric Acid                      

Minimum Shipping

Quantity   44,000 lbs

1354000 10,000 Wet lbs 3.2 1.2360$     

27.

Liquid Oxygen 
Minimum Shipping

Quantity                396,000 Gal 3.2 No Bid



28.

Hydrogen Peroxide 

34%    Minimum 

Shipping Quantity   

41,060lbs

1730000 413,170 Wet Lbs 3.2 0.5820$     

-$       

-$       

-$       

1. Methanol 1877000 7,000 Gal  $                  3.20 2.2660$     

2.

Mississippi Lime 

No Bid 48,000 Lbs  $                  3.20 No Bid

3. T-Floc 1417 2448000 32,900 Lbs  $                  3.20 1.7510$     

4.

Calcium 

Hypochlorite 2 5/8" 

Tabs

1282260 48,000 Dry Lbs  $                  3.20 2.9355$     

6.

TI-2904  330lb 

Drum   Minimum 

Shipping Quantity 4 

drums

2586100 5,280 Wet Lbs  $                  3.20 2.2900$     

7.

TI-2904  610lb 

Drum  Minimum 

Shipping Quantity 4 

drums

2586101 9,760 Wet Lbs  $                  3.20 1.9900$     



-$       

#REF!
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